From: Andrew Pringle
To: Katie Dana
Subject: RE: Revised Drawing Attached - Electrical Labor and Floor Work Quote Requested - booth 611 - NFPA show in June
Date: Thursday, April 27, 2023 11:27:34 AM
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Good Morning Katie,

Thank you for the updated floor plan. | just sent the receipt and updated the order to include the 2 requested power strips on the floor plan. The floor work will be completed before carpet is down and
should be ready for when you arrive to move-in.

As an reminder, we only charge for actual labor and material used on site and will update your invoice at the beginning of the show. If you need anything on site you can visit our service desk and we will be
glad to help.

If you have any other questions please let me know and have a wonderful day.

DLEN Andrew Pringle | Event Services Coordinator

The Power People Office: 7023225707 | Mobile: 725.276.2143 | apringle@edlen.com

6705 South Eastern Avenue | Las Vegas, NV 89119
[ £ o) in W

[CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

[This email is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. It may contain information that s legally privileged,
onfidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If an addressing or transmission error has misdirected this message notify the author by replying|
o it. If you are not the intended recipient you may not use, disclose, copy, print o rely on this message and any such use is strictly prohibited.

From: Katie Dana <kdana@ampminc.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 4:05 AM

To: Andrew Pringle <apringle@edlen.com>

Subject: Revised Drawing Attached - Electrical Labor and Floor Work Quote Requested - booth 611 - NFPA show in June

Hi Andrew,

Please find our revised electrical plan with the main drop noted as a triangle. At your earliest convenience, please confirm safe receipt.
Katie Dana

+1 7.8814

kdana@ampminc.com
ampminc.com

From: Andrew Pringle <apringle@edlen.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 11:15 AM

To: Katie Dana <kdana@ampminc.com>

Subject: RE: Floor Work - Electrical Labor and Floor Work Quote Requested - booth 611 - NFPA show in June

Good Morning Katie,

For the power strips and extension cords we only charge for actual labor and material used so we update the invoice at the start of show with materials used. | do see that you have two marked on the floor
plan so | can add those manually to the order. If you need any additional power strips you can visit the service desk and we can hand them to you. The floor work will be done before they lay the carpet down.

The only thing I am missing on the floor plan is where you would like the main drop to be located. Just let me know where you would like that and | can get that updated for you.

I ’LEN Andrew Pringle | Event Services Coordinator

The Power People Office: 702.322.5707 | Mobile: 725.276.2143 | apringle@edlen.com

6705 South Eastern Avenue | Las Vegas, NV 89119
[  HCRini¥

[CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

[This email is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. It may contain information that is legally privileged,
onfidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If an addressing or transmission error has misdirected this message notify the author by replying
o it. If you are not the intended recipient you may not use, disclose, copy, print or rely on this message and any such use is strictly prohibited.

From: Katie Dana <kdana@ampminc.com>

Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 10:25 AM

To: Andrew Pringle <apringle@edlen.com>

Subject: Floor Work - Electrical Labor and Floor Work Quote Requested - booth 611 - NFPA show in June

Hi Andrew,

We ordered our electrical that is on the on-line form today to match your note below for booth 611 on behalf of Reliable Automatic Sprinkler Co Inc. However, there isn’t an area for us to order the power
strips, extension cords or tape. | am assuming this is something that will be billed at actual and used as needed and doesn’t need to be on the order?

Also, where do we submit the electrical drawing for your electricians? Since we forwarded it to you for estimating, do you file it with the project so your team has it?

We are setting up the booth on June 17t 50 the floor work would need to be completed prior to then.

Thank you for your help with the below quote. It helps on our end for budgeting purposes. Have a wonderful weekend.

At your convenience, please confirm receipt of our electrical grid drawing and let us know if we are all set on the order.

Katie Dana
+1 7.8814
kdana@ampminc.com
ampminc.com

From: Andrew Pringle <apringle@edlen.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 11:38 AM
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To: Katie Dana <kdana@ampminc.com>
Subject: RE: Floor Work - Electrical Labor and Floor Work Quote Requested

Good Morning Katie,

| can provide an estimate for you based on the floor plan. If you order early with the advanced pricing the estimate is as follows:

5-5A @ $105 = $525

5-10A @ $182 = $910

2 power strips @ $25 = $50

10 - 15’ extension @ $22 = $220

2-Tape @ $13.50 - $27

Labor of 4 hours of Straight time @ $106 = $424

Labor of 2 hours dismantle of Straight time @ 106 = $212

Total amount of the estimate is $2,368. Keep in mind that is an estimate and only actual labor and material utilized onsite will be billed to your final invoice.

Let me know if you have only questions.

DLEN Andrew Pringle | Event Services Coordinator

e Pow - Office: 702.322.5707 | Mobile: 725.276.2143 | apringle@edlen.com
6705 South Eastern Avenue | Las Vegas, NV 89119
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From: Katie Dana <kdan mpmin m>

Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 4:57 AM

To: Andrew Pringle <apringle@edlen.com>

Subject: Floor Work - Electrical Labor and Floor Work Quote Requested

Hi Andrew,

Will you please provide us a formal quote for the floor work that includes the extension cords for the attached electrical grid. Please note the diagonal direction of the booth. We have included a photo of the
booth below that goes with the attached electrical plan grid with the outlets needed.
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ampminc.com

From: Andrew Pringle <apringle@edlen.com>
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 4:35 PM
To: Katie Dana <kdana@ampminc.com>
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Subject: RE: [External] Katrina Dana has requested assistance from Exhibitor Services
Good Afternoon Katrina,

The extension cords used will depend on where the outlets are located. Once we have the floor plan we will set everything up before the carpet is laid and update the invoice at the start of show as we only
charge actuals for materials and labor used.

If you have any questions let me know.

I ’LEN Andrew Pringle | Event Services Coordinator

The Power People Office: 702.322.5707 | Mobile: 725.276.2143 | apringle@edlen.com

6705 South Eastern Avenue | Las Vegas, NV 89119
e 0o
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From: Mandalay Bay Exhibitor Services <exhibitorservices@mandalaybay.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 30, 2023 11:50 AM

To: kdana@ampminc.com; Mandalay Bay <mandalaybay@edlen.com>

Cc: Mandalay Bay Exhibitor Services <exhibitorservices@mandalaybay.com>
Subject: RE: [External] Katrina Dana has requested assistance from Exhibitor Services

Good morning

| am looping in our Electrical team @mandalaybay@edlen.com who will be able to answer your queries for you.
Thank you
Judy Wright

Mandalay Exhibitor Services Team

LAS v

HANDALAY DAY

Fou Sexsoss Hore,
Haxs Tiras

Toll free number — 877.847.7007
Website for user friendly on-line ordering —
https://www.mandalaybayexhibi i

From: Mandalay Bay Convention Resort <info@mandalaybayexhibitorservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 30, 2023 11:37 AM
To: Mandalay Bay Exhibitor Services <exhibitorservices@mandalaybay.com>

Subject: [External] Katrina Dana has requested assistance from Exhibitor Services

A customer has requested assistance regarding Other for the NFPA Conference & Expo 2023 show.
The following are the relevant details provided by the customer:

Person to contact: Katrina Dana
For exhibitor: AMPM Inc.
How to contact: by E-Mail (kdana@ampminc.com)

Question:
We need to figure out how much the extension cords will be if we have drops located throughout the booth. | didn' t see
them on the order form. This would be concerning floor work needed for under the carpet electrical. Please advise.
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